3/24/2014 Nunawut Water Board Mail - Re: 140220 1BH-BLT----- Information Required
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Re: 140220 1BH-BLT----- Information Required

Cory Zyla <cory.zyla@nwb-oen.ca> Tue, Mar 18, 2014 at 11:56 AM
To: Marc Losier <marc@mosher.ca>
Cc: Megan Porter <megan.porter@nwb-oen.ca>

Hi Marc,

As per previous correspondence, the NWB still requires the payment of fees before it can proceed to process your Type B application for Baker Lake ($30.00
admin and $30.00 water use deposit fee).

Please feel free to contact me directly should you have any questions or concerns at cory.zyla@nwb-oen.ca or (867) 360-6338 (x36).
Regards,

S W Cory Zyla- dldn. 7Ac
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.,—‘t, Merci de penser a lenvironnement avant dimprimer ce courriel /“Thank yon for thinking of the environment before printing this email

On Thu, Feb 20, 2014 at 10:00 AM, Megan Porter <megan.porter@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:
Hi Marc,

The Nunawt Water Board is requesting a $ 30.00 Administration fee & a $ 30.00 water use deposit fee for the file 1BH-BLT----.
You can call our office and provide valid credit card information and/or have a cheque in the amount of $ 60.00 made payable to "Receiver General" sent by mail
to our office.

Thanks
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WARNING - This communication, including wy attachments contains conlidential infommation miended only for the addressec(s) noded above, Any unathorzed
distribution, copying, or dizclosure i strictly prohibited. If you have recerved this by mistale, please notify the sender immediately and delete this message without printing, or
copying it. Thank you.
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la présente avizée qu'il ui est strictement interdit de le dittnszer, le distribuer ou le reproduire. Si le destinataire ne peut étre joint ou vous est inconnw, veuillez intormer
lexpéditeur par courrier électronique imm édiatement et détruire ce message et toute copie de celui-ci. Merci pour votre collaboration.

bi.] Merci de penzer a 'environnement avant d'imprimer ce courriel / Thank yon for thinking of the environment before printing thiz email
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