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From: Melissa Joy

To: Nunatta Environmental

Cc: Andrew Keim; Phyllis Beaulieu

Subject: Re: 1237061 Project: Landfarm Discharge Water (1BR-NUN)
Date: Monday, September 17, 2012 2:13:33 PM

Attachments: Untitled attachment 00057.dat

Hi Axel,

I have nothing in writing from the NWB confirming which criteria are acceptable for this licence; none are
specifically provided in the water licence. As such, | must default to the most stringent standard we have
available. Previous pre-discharge results from Nunatta this summer have met this criteria. Provided your
(re)sample results meet the criteria you will be able to discharge; | look forward to reviewing when you
have them available.

Thank you,
Melissa

>>> Nunatta Environmental <nunatta@northwestel.net> 9/17/2012 3:52 PM >>>

Mellisa

Thank you for that. I'm confused, | thought if we met the Canadian Drinking Water Standards we were
OK to discharge. As you know the water would be discharged into the adjacent property, the old metal
dump.

We have restarted the filtering process and we let it run for another couple of days. Trust this is OK.
Axel Have

Nunatta Environmental

On 17/9/2012 9:30 AM, Melissa Joy wrote:

Hi Axel,

Notice of intent to discharge received; provided your water meets the criteria you are able
to discharge. Currently, you exceed the CCME Freshwater Aquatic standard for toluene. |
suggest you run this water through your filter again and re-sample to verify.

Melissa

Melissa Joy, B. Env Sc.

Water Resource Officer

Aboriginal Affairs & Northern Development Canada
P.O. Box 100, Igaluit, NU, X0A OHO

PH: (867) 975-4288

FAX: (867) 979-6445

email: melissa.joy@aandc.gc.ca

This transmission is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure,

distribution, or other use is strictly prohibited. If you have received

this message in error, please contact sender immediately and delete this

transmission and any attachments.

>>> Nunatta Environmental <nunatta@northwestel.net> 9/14/2012 2:23 PM >>>
Melissa

We are hereby requesting your approval to discharge water The test results are attached .
We will discharge the water through a carbon filter.

Axel Have

Nunatta Environmental
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Glen Molloy                                                                                  June 18, 2010


Nunavut Excavating


Iqaluit, NU


X0A 0H0





RE: Nunavut Research Institute, Environmental Clean Up – Our File 10-1012


Glen


Further to our conversation on June 18, 2010 regarding the status of the above project. On June 9, 2010 our Environmental Technician took 3 water samples and 4 soil samples in the excavation at the Research Institute. The samples were sent to Paracel Laboratories in Ottawa. We requested the Lab analyze the samples for Volatiles and Hydrocarbon contaminates.


On June 14, 2010 Paracel Laboratories forwarded the Certificate of Analysis showing the results of the Lab analysis. The results indicate the soils are acceptable in Accordance to Canadian Wide Standards. However the water samples failed. The results indicate two of the water samples contains Hydrocarbon contaminates of 586 and 247 PPM. The acceptable Government Environmental standards for point discharge are 15PPM.


This means the water will have to be filtered, contained in storage, tested in a Laboratory, request permission from the Regulatory Authorities to release and if acceptable, release the water into the Environment. As you can imagine this is a very costly process. Based on the dimension and depth of the excavation there is approximately 42,500 liters (or 204 barrels) of contaminated water in the excavation. The cost to set up the water/oil separator and carbon vessel filtering system is $180/ barrel. The total estimated cost to filter and clean the water is $36,720 plus laboratory cost.


We understand you will be back in Iqaluit on June 22. I suggest we discuss this further at that time.





Axel Have


VP of Operations


Nunatta Environmental Services


Iqaluit, NU




-------- Original Message --------

Subject:Fwd: Fwd: 1237061 Project: Landfarm Dishcarge Water
Date:Thu, 13 Sep 2012 16:53:53 -0400
From:Nunatta Environmental <nunatta@northwestel.net>

To:andew.keim@inac-ainc.gc.ca

-------- Original Message --------

Subject:Fwd: 1237061 Project: Landfarm Dishcarge Water
Date:Thu, 13 Sep 2012 16:44:30 -0400
From:Nunatta Environmental <nunatta@northwestel.net>

To:andrew.kein@inac.ainc.gc.ca

Andrew

Attached hereto are the test results of some water we are requesting your approval to
discharge. The water will be discharged through a carbon filter.

Axel Have

Nunatta Environmental

———————— Original Message --------
Subject:1237061 Project: Landfarm Dishcarge Water
Date:Thu, 13 Sep 2012 16:13:24 -0400

From:Mark Foto <mfoto@paracellabs.com>
To:'nunatta@northwestel.net' <nunatta@northwestel.net>

Your sample results are included in the attached certified report.

In an effort to improve efficiency and reduce waste, this electronic final report
will not be followed by a mailed hard copy report. An electronic invoice will
also follow by email to your attention unless an alternate address has been
previously provided.

If you are experiencing any difficulties with our electronic reports, or have any
other comments or questions about us going paperless, please let us know now
so that we can resolve any issues.

Thank you for using Paracel.

Mark Foto

Lab Manager, Environmental

=

2319 St.Laurent Blvd., Suite 300
Ottawa, Ontario, K1G 4J8

p: (613) 731-9577

t: 1-800-749-1947
mfoto@paracellabs.com
www.paracellabs.com

NVLAP Asbestos On-Site Assessment - O Non-Conformances = Perfect
Score!
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All 1SO 17025:2005 Accredited Labs ARE NOT Equal! Paracel's "Gold
Standard"*

See Our Laboratory and Depot Locations

Information contained in this email and any of its attachments is confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual(s) or entity that it is addressed or otherwise directed to. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying or other use of the information is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify the sender by reply email and delete the message
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