
Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> 

Re: Turner Lake 2BE-TRN0813
1 message

Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Fri, Mar 21, 2014 at 2:34 PM 
To: Lorne Warner <lornemwarner@gmail.com> 

Good afternoon Lorne
The following is a summary of water use fees owing on this licence.  Please keep in mind that Licensees pay for the authorized use of water and not the actual 
amount used.  The licence authorizes the use of 100 m3/day

Only1 payment has been received on this file in the amount of $30.00 which was all that was asked for prior to the attached letter and calculator that was issued 
from AANDC and our Chairman

Owe for 2009 $30.00
Owe for 2010 $30.00
Owe for 2011 $365.00
Owe for 2012 $365.00
Owe for 2013 $88.00 (partial year) (see attached)

On Fri, Mar 21, 2014 at 12:13 PM, Lorne Warner >lornemwarner@gmail.com<  wrote:
Hi Phyllis

I am editing a few changes to the 2008 and 2009 annual reports on the Turner Lake Project, adding details as requested in the license, but before they are 
submitted to you I have calculated the water used for drilling. 

In 2008 a total of 2534.4 m3 used over 44 days or an average of 6.94m3/day for the year.
In 2009 a total of 576.0 m3 were used for drilling over 10 days for a yearly average of 1.58m3/day. 
No water has been used since 2009.

Can you please indicate what the company still owes the Water Board based on these calculations.

Thank you

Lorne Warner P.Geo

On Tue, Jan 28, 2014 at 8:42 AM, Phyllis Beaulieu >oen.ca-phyllis.beaulieu@nwb<  wrote:
As per our telecon attached is a copy of the current licence and the calculator for determining amount required for water use fees. The link to our ftp site and 
this file is as follows. When prompted the USERNAME is public and the PASSWORD is registry

ftp://nunavutwaterboard.org/1%20PRUC/2%20MINING%20MILLING/2B/2BE%20-%20Exploration/2BE-TRN0813%20Rockgate/

If you have any additional questions please don't hesitate to contact our office

Regards, 
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3 attachments

110506 Excel Spreadsheet Water Use Fee Calculator.XLS
1355K 

110620 Chairmans Letter Water Use Fee Calculation-OMLE.pdf
64K 

140321 Water Fee Tool.xlsx
12K 
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