
From: Paul Clow
To: Phyllis Beaulieu
Subject: RE: Trail Area Deposit follow up
Date: Wednesday, October 12, 2011 9:51:28 AM

Hi Phyllis,
 
Yes we did, but we feel that this project should be completed this year to deal with spring run-off
in May.
 
Paul Clow
Project Officer
Engineering Department
 
City of Iqaluit
Box 460, Iqaluit, NU
X0A 0H0
 
Work: (867)979-6363 ext.233
Cell: (867)222-2968
Email: p.clow@city.iqaluit.nu.ca
 

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:licensing@nunavutwaterboard.org] 
Sent: October-12-11 11:39 AM
To: Paul Clow
Subject: RE: Trail Area Deposit follow up
 
Hi Paul, did you ever receive the attached notifying you of the expiry of the licence for the Trail
Area Deposit?
Regards,
 

From: Paul Clow [mailto:P.Clow@city.iqaluit.nu.ca] 
Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2011 6:16 AM
To: licensing@nunavutwaterboard.org
Cc: Meagan Leach
Subject: Trail Area Deposit follow up
Importance: High
 
Hi Phyllis,
 
This is a follow up to the letter that was submitted on September 23, 2011. We are now in the
middle of October and because of weather conditions we are running out of time to complete the
upgrades in the Trail Area Deposit. If you don't respond by Monday October 17, 2011, we are going
to move forward and complete this project.
 
Sincerely,
 
Paul Clow

mailto:P.Clow@city.iqaluit.nu.ca
mailto:licensing@nunavutwaterboard.org


Project Officer
Engineering Department
 
City of Iqaluit
Box 460, Iqaluit, NU
X0A 0H0
 
Work: (867)979-6363 ext.233
Cell: (867)222-2968
Email: p.clow@city.iqaluit.nu.ca
 


