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a@’ NWE Tools Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>
e -

Re: 150527 3BC-BGI0813 Application for Cancellation - Deficiencies Required-OMLE

1 message

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Jun 24, 2015 at 9:08 AM
To: Brad Danielson <bdd@ualberta.ca>
Cc: Brady MacCarl <brady.maccarl@nwb-oen.ca>

Good morning Brad, all that is required is a brief summary indicating your request to cancel the licence and the reason for
cancellation. Very brief and to the point is all that is required..
Regards,

Phyllis Beaulieu- 6\ >c b

Manager of Licensing- Responsable des Permis
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On Mon, Jun 15, 2015 at 2:49 PM, Brad Danielson <bdd@ualberta.ca> wrote:
Hello Phyllis and Brady,

| was taking care of this application for cancellation on behalf of Martin Sharp. I've been away on extended fieldwork, so
I'm sorry for the late response.

| was unaware that the request for cancellation needed to be translated. | can certainly have this done, but just wanted to
seek clarification: do you want the whole Application for License Cancellation form translated, or perhaps just parts 7 & 8
of the form - or are you looking for a separate letter requesting cancellation?

Also, | wrote a personal cheque for the license cancellation fee of $30. Would you kindly provide a receipt for that
payment?

Thank-you,
Brad

Brad Danielson

Post-Doctoral Fellow

Department of Earth and Atmospheric Sciences
2-030 CCIS Bldg.

University of Alberta

Edmonton, AB, CAN

T6G 2E3
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Date: Wed, May 27, 2015 at 11:38 AM

Subject: 150527 3BC-BGI0813 Application for Cancellation - Deficiencies Required-OMLE
To: Martin Sharp <martin.sharp@ualberta.ca>

Cc: Brady MacCarl <brady.maccarl@nwb-oen.ca>

The Nunavut Water Board acknowledges receipt on April 15, 2015 of your application for cancellation. In order to move
forward the following is required administratively.

1. Request for cancellation in English and Inuktitut
A review of your expired licence indicates no outstanding obligations remain.
Regards,

Phyllis Beaulieu- &> >c D>

Manager of Licensing- Respensabla des Permis
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Martin Sharp

Professor

Department of Earth and Atmospheric Sciences
1-26 Earth Science Building

University Campus NW

University of Alberta

Edmonton, Ab, T6G 2E3, Canada

Tel: (1) 780 492 8546
Office Location: Centennial Center for Interdisciplinary Science, Room 2-281 (West Wing)
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