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Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca>

Confirmation of the furnishing of security - 2AM-BRP1831 

Matthew Pickard <mpickard@sabinagoldsilver.com> Thu, Jan 10, 2019 at 11:36 AM
To: Dave Baines <dave.baines@nwb-oen.ca>, Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>
Cc: Merle Keefe <mkeefe@sabinagoldsilver.com>, John Roesch <srproject@kitia.ca>, Geoff Clark
<dirlands@kitia.ca>, "Parsons, Ian (AADNC/AANDC)" <ian.parsons@canada.ca>, "Allain, Erik (AADNC/AANDC)"
<erik.allain@canada.ca>, "Fraser, Jeremy (AADNC/AANDC)" <jeremy.fraser@canada.ca>

Dave,

 

As required under Part C Sections 6 and 7 of 2AM-BRP1831 Sabina is required to provide written
confirmation to the NWB, KIA and CIRNAC that security has been posted.  Due to the Christmas break, and
ongoing discussions between Sabina and CIRNAC, this took longer then the prescribed 10 days.  Sabina has
attached confirmations from KIA (Email) and CIRNA (Letter) that Security has been finished.

 

If you have any questions please let me know.

 

Regards, Matthew

 

Matthew Pickard B.Sc., MBA, P.Geo, CRSP, EP

Vice President, Environment & Sustainability

Sabina Gold & Silver Corp.

Suite 1800, Two Bentall Centre

555 Burrard Street

Box 220

Vancouver, BC  V7X 1M7

Tel (Direct): 604.484.8967/416.848.1184

Tel (Vancouver Reception): 888.648.4218

Cell: 416.605.7881

Fax (Vancouver): 604.998.1051

Email: mpickard@sabinagoldsilver.com

 

mailto:mpickard@sabinagoldsilver.com
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This email is intended only for the use of the individual(s) to whom it is addressed and may be privileged and
confidential. 
Unauthorised use or disclosure is prohibited. If you receive this e-mail in error, please advise me immediately
and delete the original message.  
This message may have been altered without your or our knowledge and the sender does not accept any
liability for any errors or omissions in the message.

Ce courriel est confidentiel et protégé. L'expéditeur ne renonce pas aux droits et obligations qui s'y
rapportent.  
Toute diffusion, utilisation ou copie de ce message ou des renseignements qu'il contient par une personne
autre que le (les) destinataire(s) désigné(s) est interdite. 
Si vous recevez ce courriel par erreur, veuillez m'en aviser immédiatement, par retour de courriel ou par un
autre moyen.

 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Geoff Clark <dirlands@kitia.ca> 
To: Matthew Pickard <mpickard@sabinagoldsilver.com> 
Cc: "'John Roesch'" <srproject@kitia.ca>, "'Tannis Bolt'" <projectofficer@kitia.ca> 
Bcc:  
Date: Fri, 4 Jan 2019 22:28:42 +0000 
Subject: Letter of Credit for BAck River Project 

Hi Matt,

Today KIA received an irrevocable letter of credit for $1,176,934.00 from the Royal Bank for Sabina Gold and
Silver Corp.

 

As per Part C, Section 2 of the Type A Water License: $1,176,934 has been provided to KIA in an irrevocable
letter of credit for the remainder of the Initial Infrastructure.  KIA continues to hold the additional $1,485,666
under the Type B Initial Development Works Water License which will be moved under the Type A once the
Type B is canceled.  Thus KIA is in possession of the full $2,662,600 as required under the staged bonding
for Initial Infrastructure under the Type A Water License for the Back River Project.

 

Thanks,

Geoff
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2 attachments

Acceptance of Security for Back River Project. Phase one Security -Initial infrastructure.pdf 
294K

noname.eml 
47K
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