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Fwd: Water compensation Agreement

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Mon, Jan 20, 2014 at 9:28 AM
To: David Hohnstein <david.hohnstein@nwb-oen.ca>, Karén Kharatyan <karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca>, Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>

this is the only thing that came in for MEA

Phyllis Beaulieu- > >c D>
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NUNAVUT WATER BOARD - OFFICE DES EAUX DU NUNAVUT
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www.nwh-oen.ca

PO Box 119 C.p. 119 NNSB3\L 119 Titigagagvia 119
Gjoa Haven, NU, X0B 110 Gijoa Haven (Nunavut), X0B 110 AR 5a BC0B 11D Ughugtiug, NU, X0B 110

Toll Free / Sans Frais / AP <0% / Akiittuq: 1 -835 — 521 - 3745
Tel / Téléphone / ¥L¥PC / Hivayauta: (867) 360-6338 | Fax / Télécopieur / Ab<*d®/ Fax-kut: (867) 360-6369
WARNING - This communication, including mmy attechments contuing confidential information miended only for the addresseels) noted above, Any unauthorized

distribution, copying. or dizclosure iz strictly prohibited. If you have received this by mistale, jpleaze notify the sender inmediarely and delete this message without printing or
copying it. Thank you.

AVIS DE CONFIDENTIALITE - Cle message, ¢f loulels) piceels) jombe(s) el confidentic] b el & Pusage exclusil dufes) destinatairels) ei-dessus, Toule aulre persome esl par

la présente avisée qu'il lui est strictement interdit de le dittuzer, le distribuer ou le reproduire. Si le destinataire ne peut étre joint ou vous est inconn, veuillez informer
lexpéditeur par courier électronigque immédiatement et détruire ce message ef toute cople de celui-cl Merci pour votre collaboration,

h% Merci de penser a l'environnement avant d'imprimer ce courriel / Thank yon for thinking of the environment before printing this email

---------- Forwarded message -------—-

From: Luis Manzo <dirlands @kivalliginuit.ca>
Date: Fri, Jan 17, 2014 at 4:17 PM

Subject: Water compensation Agreement

To: licensing@nunawtwaterboard.org

Cc: Veronica <vattuinee@kivalliginuit.ca>

AEM Meadowbank Water license type” A” amendment

This is to inform the board and also request the presentation of the formal compensation letter confirming the final agreement for water compensation KIA will
manage to finalize the assessment and now we will completed the negotiation with the proponent

KIA is finishing the water compensation assessment for Meadowbank, the next step is to meet with AEM to agree with the amount of the compensation to be
paid. This will take place next week (January 22 - 23). After this meeting KIA will send a final letter following week (January 27-31)to your office confirming the
final agreement.

If you have any question please call me at 1-867-645-5731

Regards,

Luis Manzo P,Ag.

Director of lands
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