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2AM-MEA1526 Guidance of the Nunavut Water Board (NWB) Process: Water
Compensation

Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Feb 27, 2019 at 8:53 AM
To: Jamie Quesnel <jamie.quesnel@agnicoeagle.com>
Cc: Karén Kharatyan <karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca>

Good morning Jamie,
Please see below.
Regards,

Richard
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca>

Date: Wed, Feb 27, 2019 at 8:45 AM

Subject: 2AM-MEA1526 Guidance of the Nunavut Water Board (NWB) Process: Water Compensation

To: <gkarlik@kivalliginuit.ca>, <dominique.girard@agnicoeagle.com>

Cc: Karén Kharatyan <karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca>, Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca>, Stephanie
Autut <stephanie.autut@nwb-oen.ca>, Teresa Meadows <tmeadows@meadowslaw.ca>

Good morning,

Please see attached for Guidance of the Nunavut Water Board (NWB) Process: Water Compensation Determination in
Relation to the Amendment to Water Licence No. 2AM-MEA1526 by Agnico Eagle Mines Limited to Allow In-Pit Tailings
Deposition at the Meadowbank Gold Mine.

Regards,

Richard
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2 attachments

-E 190227 2AM-MEA1526 Tailing In-Pit Deposition Water Compensation Determination-OEDE.pdf
397K

ﬂ 190226 Water Compensation Guide and Agreement.pdf
638K
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