
Robert Hunter <robert.hunter@nwb-oen.ca>

2AM-MRY1325 Type A Water Licence Short Term Renewal Application
Robert Hunter <robert.hunter@nwb-oen.ca> Fri, Feb 28, 2025 at 10:56 AM
To: Elisabeth Luther <Elisabeth.Luther@baffinland.com>
Cc: Karén Kharatyan <karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca>, Abid Jan <abid.jan@nwb-oen.ca>, licensing <licensing@nwb-
oen.ca>, Lou Kamermans <lou.kamermans@baffinland.com>

Good morning Elisabeth,

The Nunavut Water Board acknowledges receipt of your Application for a Short Term Renewal Water Licence. We would
like to request submission of the $30 application fee before we continue processing. This can be paid either by Cheque
made payable to: Receiver General of Canada or by credit card over the phone, you can reach me at: 1-867-360-6338
extension 28.

Regards,

Robert Hunter
Licensing Administrator

On Fri, Feb 28, 2025 at 7:10 AM Elisabeth Luther <Elisabeth.Luther@baffinland.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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