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Fwd: COMMERCIAL LEASE — RECLAMATION SECURITY NOTICE OF DEFAULT

Stephen Williamson Bathory <SWBathory@gqia.ca> Thu, May 17, 2018 at 2:29 PM
To: Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca>, William Napier <william.napier@baffinland.com>, Christopher Murray
<christopher.murray@baffinland.com>, Fai Ndofor <FNdofor@gia.ca>

Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>, Spencer Dewar <Spencer.Dewar@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>

Hello,

| can report back that the parties have come to an agreement upon a security figure for the 2018 Work Plan Amendment.
Today Baffinland is processing the security payment, confirmation of receipt may take until tomorrow. Provided the NWB
will accept this approach, the parties would prefer to confirm all the relevant facts tomorrow once QIA can confirm
receipt of the full security amount for 2018. QIA will provide the NWB with copies of the following: QIA security
assessment, and, QIA confirmation of amount received

In addition the parties can supply the NWB with a joint submission confirming the above.
Independent of this BIMC will file with NWB their 2018 Work Plan Amendment.

| have copied Mr. Spencer Dewar (INAC) as he has been made aware of the work of the parties to come to a revised
agreement upon security.

Please let me know if you have questions relating to any of the above.
Regards, SWB

From: Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca>

Sent: May 17, 2018 4:09 PM

To: Stephen Williamson Bathory <SWBathory@QIA.ca>; William Napier <william.napier@baffinland.com>; Christopher
Murray <christopher.murray@baffinland.com>; Fai Ndofor <FNdofor@QlA.ca>

Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>

Subject: Re: COMMERCIAL LEASE — RECLAMATION SECURITY NOTICE OF DEFAULT

Dear all,

NWB would appreciate an update on the status of security posting for 2AM-MRY 1325, as the previously discussed deadline
expires today.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6a382f14 1f&jsver=GAFHaMvshdw.en.&cbl=gmail_fe_180506.06_p7&view=pt&msg=1636fch83cf74d9f&search=inbox&dsq
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On Fri, May 11, 2018 at 1:47 PM, Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:

Good afternoon Stephen,
Thank you for the clarification. The deadline is now set as May 17, 2018.

Regards,
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On Fri, May 11, 2018 at 1:29 PM, Stephen Williamson Bathory <SWBathory@qia.ca> wrote:

Hello,

In response to a request for an update from the NWB, the notice of default issued by QIA (see attached) requires
Baffinland to address the posting of financial security within 15 business days. The deadline for posting security is May

17t 2018.

QIA will provide the NWB an update on the status of security not later than May 17t 2018.

Regards, Stephen.

From: Stephen Williamson Bathory

Sent: April 26, 2018 8:49 AM

To: 'William Napier' <william.napier@baffinland.com>

Cc: 'stephanie.autut@nwb-oen.ca' <stephanie.autut@nwb-oen.ca>

Subject: COMMERCIAL LEASE — RECLAMATION SECURITY NOTICE OF DEFAULT

Hello Mr. Napier,

Please find attached a letter pertaining to 2018 financial security.

Regards, Stephen.

A< PACh <Dn / <UI*b® AlLn<otor Acn<loS
Stephen Williamson Bathory / Director of Major Projects
swbathory@qia.ca / 867.975.8418

PP*Co AbAC bD*3bNFLC
Qikigtani Inuit Association
1.800.667.2742

/bcDtd< / Fax : 867.979.3238
www.gia.ca
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WARNING: The information contained in this e-mail communication is confidential and intended only for the use of the intended recipient. If you are not the
intended recipient, please notify us at the telephone number shown above or by return e-mail and delete this communication and any copy immediately.
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