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Licence 2BB-MEA1828 application for amendment

Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Nov 13, 2019 at 3:24 PM
To: David Frenette <david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com>
Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>

Good evening David,

Could you please clarify what the new water source is going to be? Is there hydrological information available confirming that the
source is capable of maintaining the requested withdrawal rate?

Thank you,

Assol Kubeisinova- <MN® dAAZ 0
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On Wed, Nov 13, 2019 at 11:38 AM Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:
Good morning,

The Nunavut Water Board acknowledges receipt. A technical advisor will review the submission and may contact you for
additional information.

Regards,

Richard
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On Wed, Nov 13, 2019 at 7:02 AM David Frenette <david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com> wrote:

Good Morning,

Please find attached documents required to apply for an amendment to the water licence 2BB-MEA1828:

NWB form: 2BB-MEA1828 amendment application 20191113.pdf

NPC conformity determination: 149209 - LUP - Not a Significant Modification - screening not required.pdf
Applicable NIRB decision: 161005-11EN010 Screening Decision Report-OT3E.pdf

List of meetings conducted: Amarug meetings 2019-10-29.pdf

Spill Contingency Plan: Spill Contingency Plan 2BB-MEA1828 2BE-GOT1924 version 12.pdf

Project description : Main application document_Amaruq explo camp.pdf

The $30 application fee will follow by mail. For the $30 concerning the water use, could you confirm that this amount is not
required since there is no increase of the annual water use (already paid).

Should you need additional information, please contact me,

Regards,

\

AGNICO EAGLE

David Frenette | Coordonnateur environnement
david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com | Direct 819.874.5980 ,4103622 | Mobile 819.355.9271
Agnico Eagle Mines Limited - Exploration Val-d’Or - 765, chemin de la mine Goldex - Val-d'Or, QC,
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