
Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca>

Fwd: 2BE-ANG1823 - Angilak Project


Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca> Thu, Nov 18, 2021 at 9:23 AM
To: Sergey Kuflevskiy <sergey.kuflevskiy@nwb-oen.ca>
Cc: Tara Gunson <tgunson@apexgeoscience.com>, licensing <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>

Good morning,

For clarification the annual water use of 
$1091.35 is for water licence 2BE-ANG1823.  The annual water use fee for 2BE-
NAD1722 is $30.00.

Regards,

Richard

On Thu, Nov 18, 2021 at 9:19 AM Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:

Good morning,


CIRNA confirmed they have no record of payment for 2019, 2020 and 2021, the annual water use fee is $1091.35 for a total of
$3274.05 outstanding.


Regards,


Richard


mailto:richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca








On Fri, Nov 5, 2021 at 9:15 AM Sergey Kuflevskiy <sergey.kuflevskiy@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:


Hi Tara,


Just checked the 2BE-NAD1722 file. The last receipt we have logged in our system is from 2017 when the Licence was
renewed (attached).


And the last one we have on file for 2BE-ANG1823 is from 2018 (also attached).


We have not heard from CIRNAC regarding the receipts yet. 


Let me know if you have anymore questions.


Regards,
Sergey







On Thu, Nov 4, 2021 at 7:42 PM Tara Gunson <tgunson@apexgeoscience.com> wrote:


Hi Sergey,

mailto:sergey.kuflevskiy@nwb-oen.ca
mailto:tgunson@apexgeoscience.com


I do usually pay CIRNAC directly with a credit card over the phone, but I have looked through all my records and receipts
from Sarah Forté and I cannot seem to find confirmation of payment for this
one, so It may have been missed.

 

Can you do me a huge favour and check if there was a payment made for the Dewar Lakes Camp (2BE-NAD1722)
completed by me as well on behalf of Commander? I do not seem to see a receipt for this one
either so I may have missed
this one too.

 

I have attached my calculations for each of the fees. Can you confirm if the number is correct and then I can contact Sarah
tomorrow to confirm if I did pay them or not and if not make the payment
over the phone via credit card.

 

Thanks very much!

Tara

 

Tara Gunson B.Sc. P.Geo

100, 11450 160 Street NW

Edmonton, Alberta

Canada T5M 3Y7

(780) 467-3532 – Office

(780) 604-3282 – Cell

www.apexgeoscience.com

 

From: Sergey Kuflevskiy <sergey.kuflevskiy@nwb-oen.ca>


Sent: November 4, 2021 5:27 PM

To: Tara Gunson <tgunson@apexgeoscience.com>
Subject: 2BE-ANG1823 - Angilak Project

 

Hi Tara,

 

I am reviewing the Annual Reports you submitted for the Angilak Project (2BE-ANG1823) and I can't locate the receipts for
the water use fees paid this year and last year.

 

Were the fees paid directly to CIRNAC?

 

Thank you,

http://www.apexgeoscience.com/
http://www.apexgeoscience.com/about/covid-19-update/
mailto:sergey.kuflevskiy@nwb-oen.ca
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Sergey



