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,ﬁ NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

[Licensing] RE: Reclamation of 2BE-ARC0813 (expired) —- SECOND NOTICE:

Letter of Non-Compliance
1 message

Mike England <mike@engcom.ca> Fri, Jun 5, 2015 at 4:09 PM
To: Eva Paul <Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>
Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>

Hello Eva,

| want to let you know that | have just heard back now from Wynter Kuliktana, the new lands officer at
KIA since Stanley Anablak left | guess. She would like to have the call | suggested scheduled for the
coming Tuesday so that is when | will talk to her about the bond in place and how we can make this work
in conjunction with another cleanup if possible. Alix still has negative cash but | am working on different
ideas to create financing dollars.

Do you know if, since we are long gone from the area, KIA will allow a bond to be used to pay a cleanup
expedition? | really do not know how it works up there but | think | recall you mentioning in an email that
perhaps we could work with them towards a cleanup program. | have been discussing a cleanup
expedition with a company that was recommended to me by another company that was active in
Nunavut in the past called Matrix Aviation. | will keep you posted on this and get you a website perhaps
to see if they qualify.

That is it for now, have a great weekend,

Mike

From: Eva Paul [mailto:Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca]
Sent: May-29-15 6:06 AM

To: Mike England; Englandcommunications@shaw.ca

Cc: Licensing Department
Subject: RE: Reclamation of 2BE-ARC0813 (expired) — SECOND NOTICE: Letter of Non-Compliance

Hi Mike,
Thank you for the acknowledgment. Ilook forward to hearing from you next week.

Regards,

Eva Paul
Water Resources Officer | Agent des ressources en eau

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?7ui=2&1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=inbox&th=14d... 7/27/2015
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Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada | Affaires autochtones et Développement du Nord
Canada

Nunavut Regional Office | Bureau régional du Nunavut

Building 969, PO Box 2200 | Edifice 969, CP 2200

Igaluit, NU XO0A OHO

Phone | Tél. : 867-975-4548
Cell | Mobile: 867-222-6490
Fax | Téléc. : 867-979-6445
Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

>>> "Mike England" <mike@engcom.ca> 5/28/2015 8:02 PM >>>
Hello Eva,

We are working on getting a budget this ASAP. The Company has had no cash and owes about $900,000
the last 2+ years so dealing with this has been impossible. We are going to give the Company one more
shot now — it has been restructured so it gives us a better chance, though still in debt. Regardless of that,
getting a budget on this matter is important and | am obtaining a new one now.

Sorry for the delays, | will get back to you by next week | would imagine.
Best regards,

Mike England

From: Eva Paul [mailto:Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca]

Sent: May-07-15 8:40 AM

To: Englandcommunications@shaw.ca

Subject: Fwd: Reclamation of 2BE-ARC0813 (expired) — SECOND NOTICE: Letter of Non-Compliance
Importance: High

Hello Mr. England,

I'm trying different avenues to reach you, as the contact information I have on file, and that the Nunavut
Water Board has on file has not been successful. Ijust came across this address on-line. Please confirm
receipt of this message. The message below was sent this morning to info@alixresources.com, and the
messages in January to mike@engcom.ca.

Regards,

Eva Paul

Water Resources Officer | Agent des ressources en eau

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada | Affaires autochtones et Développement du Nord
Canada

Nunavut Regional Office | Bureau régional du Nunavut

Building 969, PO Box 2200 | Edifice 969, CP 2200

Igaluit, NU X0A 0HO

Phone | Tél. : 867-975-4548

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?7ui=2&1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=inbox&th=14d... 7/27/2015
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Cell | Mobile: 867-222-6490
Fax | Téléc. : 867-979-6445
Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

>>> Eva Paul 5/7/2015 9:37 AM >>>
Mr. England,

Please acknowledge receipt of this e-mail. You will find attached a second letter of non-compliance for
the water licence 2BE-ARC0813 (Arcadia Project) and supporting documents. A first letter was sent on
January 30, 2015 to the e-mail address I have on file from past correspondence with you. No response
was received.

There is outstanding reclamation work to be conducted for this project, which poses a threat to waters and
lands in Nunavut. This project is located on Inuit-Owned Land.

Att: IQALUIT-#914287-v1-2BE-ARC0813 Second Notice Letter of Non-Compliance and other supporting
documents.

Regards,

FEva Paul

Water Resources Officer | Agent des ressources en eau

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada | Affaires autochtones et Développement du Nord
Canada

Nunavut Regional Office | Bureau régional du Nunavut

Building 969, PO Box 2200 | Edifice 969, CP 2200

Igaluit, NU X0A 0HO

Phone | Tél. : 867-975-4548
Cell | Mobile: 867-222-6490
Fax | Téléc. : 867-979-6445
Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2 &ik=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=inbox&th=14d... 7/27/2015



