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"ﬁ NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Re: NWB 2BE-HBP1116 outstanding annual fee

1 message

Mike MacMorran < mikemacmorran@gmail.com> Thu, Nov 28, 2013 at 4:43 PM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Hi Phyllis,

| was able to get in touch with Strongbow/North Arrow's previous lands administrator as she mentioned
that annual license fees are only applied during the years when the license is 'active’ (not expired). She
also mentioned to me that she checked with you not long ago about outstanding fees, and everything was
paid and up to date for the licenses. With respect to the 'annual reports’, | was directed by her to the NWB's
FTP/Public Registry - | haven't been able to find the location of any of the four licenses

(CAN,TRE,SIL,NTI) in question to see if there are reports outstanding - would you or someone at the

NWB be able to direct me to the location of the folders?

Thanks again,

Mike

On Fri, Nov 22, 2013 at 11:47 AM, Mike MacMorran <mikemacmorran@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Phyllis,
(Me again) | have another question while we're on the subject of annual fees. There are four other
licenses I'm currently working on (CAN0608, TRE0608, NTI0507, NTI0507) closing/cancelling for
Strongbow Exploration Inc.. These licenses also have outstanding annual report filings and I'm assuming
fees also. Would you be able to tell me what licenses still have outstanding fees, how much, and for what
years. Are the annual fees for a Type "B" water license just a flat fee per license, or does the size of the
area covered have an impact on the amount? And does the amount of water used and purpose
affect the rate you pay also?

Thanks Phyllis - again, much appreciated!

Mike

On Wed, Nov 20, 2013 at 1:10 PM, Mike MacMorran <mikemacmorran@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Phyllis - sorry about not getting that payment taken care of - it's a busy time for Ken (the president
of the company) at the moment. I'm going to have a cheque made up for the $189.80 that's
still outstanding (made out to the "Receiver General for Canada" of course) at the end of the month
and put it in the mail - I'll alert you when | get it sent.
Take care,
Mike
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