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—“*% NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Re: 131108 2BE-HBP1116 Status of File-OMLE

1 message

Mike MacMorran < mikemacmorran@gmail.com> Wed, Nov 13, 2013 at 11:52 AM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>
Cc: Eva Paul <Eva.Paul@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>

Hi Phyllis,
Much appreciated for the information you forwarded me!

Attached are the annual reports (Excel version) for 2011, 2012 along with the supplementary addendums
for the "Spill Contingency Plan" and "Abandonment and Restoration Plan" (see attached "North Arrow
Minerals_2011 Annual Report....pdf"). Also attached is a copy of the "Spill Cleanup Report" which has also
been sent to AANDC.

The $189.80 you mentioned in your last email (due on March 27, 2013) - | was just curious if companies are
still required to pay this even if no work is planned or carried out a? How do | go about paying this, and who
is the payment made out to (NWB?)?

Please don't hesitate to contact me if you have any comments/questions/concerns

Best regards,
Mike

On Fri, Nov 8, 2013 at 11:34 AM, Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:
Good day Mike:
Following is an update on your file:
1. Water use fees have been paid up to 2012. $189.80 was due on May 27, 2013 for an authorized use
of 52 m3/day.
2. Annual reports have not been received on this file to date and are required for 2011 and 2012. The
2013 report is not due until March 31, 2014. | have attached a copy of the form to use when submitting
the annual report. If there was no activity on site you can simply indicate this on the form for the year
being reported. As for the leaking drums noted by the AANDC Inspector, just the date of detection should
suffice.
3. I've attached a copy of your licence. Please refer to the sections on Spill Contingency Plan and
Abandonment and Restoration. Addendums were to be submitted but have not been received. Also
attached is correspondence relating to the spill plan and clean up requirements. | trust this information is
useful,
Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/?ui=2&amp:1k=6896¢ea2ed2 &amp;view=pt&amp:as from=... 11/29/2013
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2011_Annual Report for Lic#2BE-HPB1116_Hope Bay-Oro Leases_North Arrow Minerals
@ Inc_111028 REVISED Standard NWB Annual Reporting Form-FSTE.xIs
87K

_. 2012_Annual Report for Lic#2BE-HBP1116_Hope Bay-Oro Leases_North Arrow Minerals
@ Inc_111028 REVISED Standard NWB Annual Reporting Form-FSTE.xIs
93K
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@ North Arrow Minerals_2011 Annual Report for Lic#2BE-HBP1116_Hope Bay Oro Project.pdf

481K

North Arrow Minerals Inc - Hope Bay-Oro Leases_Spill Cleanup Report_NWB Itr 2BE-HBP1116

) Oct 2013.docx
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