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Re: Water Licence Cancellation - 2BE-MVP1217

1 message

Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Tue, Dec 10, 2013 at 4:46 PM
To: Christine Wilson <Christine.Wilson@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>
Cc: Clayton Pearson <Clayton.Pearson@vale.com>

Good afternoon Clayton:

Once the application is submitted, along with an admin fee of $30.00 and a brief summary in English and Inuktitut, the
NWB will send the file for review and comments. Most likely the Enforcement staff at AANDC will provide comments
that a final inspection will be necessary before cancellation is finalized. We would also need to review the file to ensure
that all reports and water use fees are up to date.

| trust this information helps.
Regards,

Phyllis Beaulieu- ¢ >c b

Manager of Licensing- Responsable des permis
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On Tue, Dec 10, 2013 at 1:56 PM, Christine Wilson <Christine.Wilson@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca> wrote:

Good Afternoon,

I would like this question to be clarified by Phyllis Beaulieu, the Manger of Licencing, NWB. I believe -which is my
understanding- clearance or a final inspection letter is required from the Inspector before the file is reviewed for
cancellation.

Please feel free to contact Justin Hack (cc'd) who is acting in Mr. Keim absence, if you have anymore questions.

Christine Wilson

Water Resource Officer- Kivalliq Region

Field Operations Unit

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada

Nunavut Regional Office
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P.O. Box 100

Igaluit, Nunavut X0OA OHO

Ph:867-975-4296

Fx: 867-979-6445

>>> Clayton Pearson <Clayton.Pearson@vale.com> 12/10/2013 8:49 AM >>>

Good morning Ms. McCaie,

I am currently in the process of completing the cancellation form for water Licence 2BE-MVP1217 and the form
indicates that I should attach either an "Application for Certificate of Completion” or a “Certificate of Closure” and
that I should discuss with AANDC regarding this provision.

Could you please advise on the steps required to obtain the Certificate?

For your reference, the most recent inspection was conducted on August 5" 2012 by Andrew Keim and has a CDIM
# 622596.

Sincere regards,

Clayton Pearson
Project Geologist

North American Exploration

Vale Exploration Canada
Hwy 17 West, Copper Cliff, Ontario, Canada POM 1NO
Phone +01 (705) 682 5128 Fax +01 (705) 682 8243 Mobile +01 (705) 618 2913

clayton.pearson@vale.com
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