From: Graham Gill [G.Gill@diamondsnorth.com]

Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2006 1:44 PM

To: NWB Manager of Licensing

Cc: Jeremy Howe

Subject: RE: Water License 2BE-PEL (Previous file number NWB2PELO0507)

Phyllis;
I will forward you a cheque today.

Graham Gill

----- Original Message-----

From: NWB Manager of Licensing [mailto:licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca]
Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2006 11:45 AM

To: 'Howe, Jeremy JJ'

Cc: 'Graham Gill'

Subject: Water License 2BE-PEL (Previous file number NWB2PEL0507)

I am in the process of completing the administrative review of the documents sent in for the assignment of this license.
Please be advised that the annual water use fee of $30.00 is due on June 30, 2006.

Phyllis Beaulieu

Manager of Licensing

Nunavut Water Board

P.O. Box 119

Gjoa Haven, NU XO0B 1J0

Phone: (867) 360-6338

Fax: (867) 360-6369

E-mail: licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca
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