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RE: 2BE-PKR1621 amendment application

1 message

David Frenette <david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com> Fri, Mar 24, 2017 at 7:04 AM
To: Karén Kharatyan <karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca>, Cynthia Ene <cynthia.ene@nwb-oen.ca>, Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>

Sorry for the delay, you're right the project is still in NIRB screening.

I'll send you by mail the original document application with the cheque associated.

Regards,

David Frenette
Environmental Coordinator

david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com

T: 819.874.5980 ,3622
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De : Karén Kharatyan [mailto:karen.kharatyan@nwb-oen.ca]
Envoyé : 6 mars 2017 16:22

A : David Frenette; Cynthia Ene; Robin Ikkutisluk

Objet : Re: 2BE-PKR1621 amendment application

Good Afternoon David,

| have a quick question related to this application package. Based on the NIRB today's correspondence the screening for this project proposal (installation of
temporary camp, airstrips and project extension) still continues?

If this is the case, the NWB will be awaiting for the completion of NIRB process to formally start its process.

Regards,

Karén Kharatyan, Ph. D- bn.®* bGN%*
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gﬁ Merci de penser 4 Pevironmenent avant d'imprimer ce counviel | Theak you for thinking of the envionmuent before prining fhis email

On Mon, Mar 6, 2017 at 7:32 AM, David Frenette <david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com> wrote:

Please find attached an application for an amendment to the water license 2BE-PKR1621. The payment for the fees will follow by mail with the original document
application.

Should you need additional information, please contact me.
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David Frenette
Environmental Coordinator

david.frenette@agnicoeagle.com

T: 819.874.5980 ,3622

Agnico Eagle Mines Limited

765, chemin de la mine Goldex c.p. 87
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