Dufresne, Andre (Toronto - Nickel)

From: Cory Zyla [cory.zyla@nwb-oen.ca)

Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2014 4:43 PM

To: Dufresne, Andre (Toronto - Nickel)

Cc: Robin ikkutisluk; Licensing Department

Subject: Re: 140212 2BE-RAI0611 Cuiiton Lake Project - Requirements of Annuail Reports
Hi Andre,

Thank-you for your message. We received Annual Reports for the following years: 2008, 2009, 2010,
and 2011. We also received your cheque for the amount of $120.00 (outstanding fees).

‘We do not have any information on record for activities conducted on-site for this licence (2BE-
RAI0611) for the years 2006 and 2007. As such, please provide Annual Reports for these years (e.g.
using the template used before), which should include information about any sampling programs
that were conducted during those years (location, base camp, transport to and from location,
staging area). We also still require a $30.00 administrative fee for processing your cancellation
application.

If you require any assistance, please feel free to contact me at (867) 360-6338 (x36).

Regards,
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On Wed, Feb 12, 2014 at 2:23 PM, <Andre.Dufresne@glencore-ca.com> wrote:
Robin,

The appropriate reports indicating that no water was consumed as well as the appropriate fees have already been
submitted and confirmed received.

Warmest regards,
Andre

From: Robin Ikkutisluk [mailto:robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca]

Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2014 01:54 PM

To: Dufresne, Andre (Toronto - Nickel)

Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>; Cory Zyla <cory.zyla@nwb-oen.ca>
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Subject: 140212 2BE-RAI0611 Culiton Lake Project - Requirements of Annual Reports
Hi Andre,

This is a reminder that under the terms and conditions of water licence 2BE-RAI0611 Part B, Item 2 you are
required to submit Annual Reports for the Cullton Lake Project .

The Nunavut Water Board hereby advises that Annual Reports be submitted for the following years prior to
processing the cancellation application:

- 2006

- 2007

- 2008

- 2009

-2010

- l201 1

We look forward to receiving your report. Should you have any questions or concerns, please do not hesitate to
d&iitact our office. '

Rl%gards,
R6bin Ikkutisluk

Robin Ikkutisluk- GA® AN

Licence Administrator Assistant- Administratrice des permis
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