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Nunavut Water Board Mail - FY2022 Blue Star Audit Request - Reclamation Security Confirmation

Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca>

FY2022 Blue Star Audit Request - Reclamation Security Confirmation

Richard Dwyer <richard.dwyer@nwb-oen.ca>

Wed, Feb 15, 2023 at 10:57 AM

To: Andrea Yuan <Andrea.Yuan@pbluestargold.ca>, Karen Cheng <kcheng@smythecpa.com>
Cc: "Joseph, Napassi" <Napassi.Joseph@rcaanc-cirnac.gc.ca>, "Keim, Andrew" <andrew.keim@rcaanc-cirnac.gc.ca>

Good morning,

Although this security amount of $1,685,542.00 is confirmed in the 2BM-ULU203 water licence, this amount is to be
furnished to the Minister, attached for your information is the CIRNA acceptance letter of security from the previous water
licence, it may still rest with the Minister, Crown Indigenous Relations Northern Affairs Canada will confirm, they're copied

to this e-mail.
Regards,
Richard
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On Wed, Feb 15, 2023 at 10:28 AM Kary Wu <kwu@smythecpa.com> wrote:

Hello Dr. Dwyer,

Hope you are doing well.

My name is Kary Wu and | am writing from Smythe LLP, auditors for Blue Star Gold Corp (the “Company”). In
connection of our 2022 audit of the Company and its subsidiaries, we are wondering if you could address the attached
reclamation security confirmation at your earliest convenience.

Please let me know if you have any questions.
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Regards,

Kary Wu, CPA

Senior Accountant

J smythe

1700 — 475 Howe St, Vancouver, BC V6C 2B3
D: 604 694 7529 T: 604 687 1231

smythecpa.com

VANCOUVER | LANGLEY | NANAIMO
Linked [T}

Smythe LLP is a member of Allinial Global, an association of legally independent accounting firms. This email and all attachments are confidential
and may contain privileged information. Any unauthorized dissemination or copying is strictly prohibited. If you have received it in error, please
delete it and notify us immediately by phone. Please consider the environment before printing this email.

2 attachments

E 190912 2BM-ULU1520 CIRNA Acceptance Bonito Capital Corp LoC-IMLE.pdf
290K

-E Nunuvat Water Board Confirmation.pdf
398K
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