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..»i‘w’z NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu < phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>
;5

RE: Igloolik Water Lic Application 2014 (Part 2 of 2)

1 message

Brian Fleming < igloolik@magma.ca> Mon, Mar 24, 2014 at 11:29 AM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Cc: "Roy, Bhabesh" <RBhabesh@gov.nu.ca>, "Ruediger, Ralph" <RRuediger@gov.nu.ca>, "Toonoo, Timoon" <TToonoo@gov.nu.ca>
Hi Phyllis

For clarification, please disregard the information sent in 2012. Although it may seem similar it has been updated or revised. As a result, | suggest NWB
consider using only the information recently sent in 2014 for our renewal, and advise me of any further information you may require.

Thanks, Brian

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca]
Sent: Monday, March 24, 2014 12:59 PM

To: Brian Fleming

Cc: Roy, Bhabesh; Ruediger, Ralph; Toonoo, Timoon
Subject: Re: Igloolik Water Lic Application 2014 (Part 2 of 2)

Thank you for the application documents. Please be advised that some information was provided in 2012 that may be duplicated with the current
submissions. Please review what was received in 2012 and advise which documents the NWB is to consider with the renewal.

Here is the link to the application folder.

ftp://nunavutwaterboard.org/1%20PRUC/3%20MUNICIPAL/3B/3BM%20-%20Municipality/3BM-1IGL0911/1%20APPLICATION/2011%20Renewal/
Regards,

& " Phyllis Beaulieu- ™ >c >
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On Thu, Mar 13, 2014 at 1:11 PM, Brian Fleming <igloolik@magma.ca> wrote:
Hi Phyllis,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?7ui=2&1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=inbox&th=144... 3/25/2014



Nunavut Water Board Mail - RE: Igloolik Water Lic Application 2014 (Part 2 of 2) Page 2 of 2

Please find attached our application and supporting documents to renew our water license with the NWB.

Our application is being sent electronically, and consists of two emails.

| would appreciate conformation from once you have received both emails, and please do not hesitate to contact me if you require additional information, or
have any questions. A scanned copy in payment of the application fee is included, and it will be mailed to your office.

Thanks in advance, Brian

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2 &1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=inbox&th=144... 3/25/2014



