
Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Application for water License Cancellation
1 message

Brad Danielson <bdd@ualberta.ca> Wed, Apr 15, 2015 at 2:05 PM
To: Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>, phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca

Hello Robin and Phyllis,

I've attached our application for the cancellation of our old license.  
I know that this needs to be accompanied by a $30 processing fee, however our department is unable to issue cheques, 
and it would be a protracted nightmare to try and do this through our supply management services department.  
If there is a way I can make this payment by credit card, please let me know.  Otherwise I will write a personal cheque 
and send it in the mail.  Would this be acceptable?

Thanks,
Brad

--
Brad Danielson
Post-Doctoral Fellow
Department of Earth and Atmospheric Sciences
2-030 CCIS Bldg.
University of Alberta
Edmonton, AB, CAN
T6G 2E3 

On Thu, Feb 5, 2015 at 3:02 PM, Robin Ikkutisluk >oen.ca-robin.ikkutisluk@nwb<  wrote:
Hi Brad,

I've attched an application for a cancellation. Please have the the forms signed and submitted along with and $30.00 application fee. 
Also any outstanding reports or water use fees will be required prior to closing the file.

Regards,
Robin
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