Nunavut Water Board Mail - Re: Water license Page 1 of 3

Fok
ﬁ.’ NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>
g - s

Re: Water license

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Fri, Mar 6, 2015 at 1:32 PM
To: Peter Huelse <peter.huelse@casp.cam.ac.uk>

Good day Peter, your attached report for 3BC-CVF1111 was already received by our office, thanks.

For BWLC-PRO156 we are still not in receipt of the application form for another approval without a licence which was
previously sent to you. Once received we will begin processing for this season.

Obligations under your Type "B" licence (3BC-PRO0914) must be met in order to consider it for closure. This would be
the submission of annual reports for 2011, 2012 and 2014. If there was no one on site for these years a cover letter
indicating this would be appreciated. There is also an outstanding water use fee of $30.00 to be paid for the last year
of the B licence.

Regards,

Phyllis Beaulieu- ¢ >c b
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On Thu, Feb 19, 2015 at 2:47 AM, Peter Huelse <peter.huelse@casp.cam.ac.uk> wrote:

Good morning Phyllis,

Thank you for your email. | have to apologize that | forgot to send you a report for our 2014 fieldwork. | will send it
to you as soon as | can together with the outstanding fees.

| am sorry to hear that no reports were send for the years 2011 and 2012. That was before | started working at
CASP. As far as | know there was no fieldwork in 2012. In 2011 one of our geologists, Stephen Rippington, joined an
expedition by the BGR (Bundesanstalt fuer Geowissenschaften und Rohstoffe, Germany). There was a report
submitted by Dr. Lutz Reinhardt (BGR) for the NWB licence 3BC-CVF1111 for their “Expedition CASE 12”. | attached
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this report to this email. Please let me know if you require a separate report or coverletter stating the Stephe R
joined the BGR expedition in 2011.

Best wishes,

Peter Hilse

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca]
Sent: 18 February 2015 17:41

To: Peter Huelse

Cc: Megan Porter; Robin Ikkutisluk

Subject: Re: Water license

Good day Peter, attached for your use is a copy of the application form for "approval without a licence" which you can
use to apply for this season. | note that 2 documents were received on January 19th, 2015, one being a map and the
other an Inuktitut summary. | believe you're waiting of the application form to complete the application.

For 3BC-PRO0914 there is a requirement to submit water use fees for June 17, 2013 to June 16, 2014 and for June
17, 2014 to the expiry of that licence. The outstanding amount is $60.00.

Also noted is that an annual report was not received for 3BBC-PRO0914 for the years 2011, 2012 and 2014. These
should be provided and if no work was carried out on the site for any of these years then a cover letter indicating
same should be filed with our Board.

Regards,

m Image
removed by
sender.
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On Wed, Feb 4, 2015 at 8:05 AM, Peter Huelse <peter.huelse@casp.cam.ac.uk> wrote:
Dear Phyllis,

How are you?

| am writing to you regarding our expired water license 3BC-PRO0914 and the application for the “Approval for the
use of water without a license” for the summer of 2015.
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1) Expired water license 3BC-PR0O0914: This license expired but I was informed by Andrew Keim that it needs to be
officially cancelled. Could you provide information on how to do that, please?

2) Application for the "Approval for the use of water without a license” for the summer of 2015: I would like to renew
our previous license 8WLC-PRO1415 will expire on February 23" 2015.

Unfortunately, I have problems loading the NWB webpage. Could you forward the required documents?

Many thanks for your help and best wishes,

Peter

Dr. Peter Hulse
Geologist - Project Leader

Canadian Arctic Islands Project

CASP

West Building

181A Huntingdon Road
Cambridge, CB3 0DH

United Kingdom

Telephone: +44(0)1223768292

Email: peter.huelse@casp.cam.ac.uk
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