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Faron
,.*E NWB Tools Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>
Y

Re: [Licensing] Re: 3BC-PVD1112 - Expired and 3BC-PVE1313 Expired - Replaced
by 8WLC-PVE1415

1 message

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Mon, Mar 2, 2015 at 4:47 PM
To: Andrew Keim <Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>

Cc: Neil Shubin <neil.shubin@gmail.com>, Licensing Department <Licensing@nwb-oen.ca>, Robin Ikkutisluk
<robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>, Erik Allain <Erik.Allain@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>

This is to advise that the following requirements are still outstanding on this file.

1. No annual report received

2. No addendum to the spill plan provided with the annual report as required under .
3. An outstanding balance for the admin fee of $2.34 CDN is still outstanding

4. The water use fee of $30.00 CDN is outstanding as well.

Regards,

& ", Phyllis Beaulieu- f\c™ >cb

9, Manager of Licensing- Responsabla des Permis
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On Tue, Feb 3, 2015 at 12:47 PM, Andrew Keim <Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca> wrote:
Robyn,

Con you confirm a cancellation request was submitted and that all the annual report etc have been filed please and
thank you .

Andrew Keim

Water Resources Officer

Field Operations Unit

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada
Nunavut Regional Office

P.O. Box 100

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?7ui=2&1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=sent&th=14bdc... 3/2/2015



Nunavut Water Board Mail - Re: [Licensing] Re: 3BC-PVDI1112 - Expired and 3BC-PVE... Page 2 of 3

Iqaluit, Nunavut X0A OHO

Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

Phone: (867) 975-4289

Fax: (867) 979-6445

B.B (867) 222- 6488

>>> Neil Shubin <neil.shubin@gmail.com> 1/21/2015 4:22 PM >>>

Hello Andrew,

Thank you for your note.

We filed a Cancellation for 3BC-PVE1313 as the collapse of our funding situation
precluded the work. We worked with Robin Ikkutisluk to rectify this matter last Winter

and Spring. | have cc'd her and await advice on how to proceed.
With thanks,

Neil

On Wed, Jan 21, 2015 at 3:15 PM, Andrew Keim <Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca> wrote:

Neil Shubin

Department of Organismal Biology and Anatomy
10127 E 57th Street

University of Chicago

Chicago, IL 60637 USA

Email: neil.shubin@gmail.com

Mr. Shubin,

The Field Operations Unit of Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada is currently engaged in

conducting our annual Risk Prioritization Exercise in preparation for the 2015 field season.

It has come to our attention that the above noted Water licenses for work conducted between 2011 and 2012
and 2013 respectively have expired and that a number of required Annual Reports remain outstanding to the

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2 &1k=6896ea2ed2 & view=pt&search=sent&th=14bdc...

Nunavut Water Board and the Inspector. Additionally a review of the files is unable to produce either an
application for renewal or an application for cancellation of the expired Licenses.

It is AANDC's understanding that the above noted license ( 3BC-PVE1313) was replaced by the Nunavut Water
Board with an annual Authority without a License ( 8WLC-PVE1415). This new Authorization without a License
however also does not release the Licensee from the Liability associated with the now expired License. The final
disposition of the expired license must still be addressed.

In addition to the enclosed assessment form to be completed and returned to our offices by March 31st 2015, |
have included a copy of your Water License . | appreciate your cooperation as we move ahead with this file.

If you have any questions or concerns please do not hesitate to contact myself or the Manager of Licensing at
the Nunavut Water Board, Phyllis Beaulieu Manager of Licensing Nunavut Water Board.
Licensing@NWB-OEN.CA

Thank you in advance for your continued cooperation,

Respectfully,

Andrew Keim

Water Resources Officer

Field Operations Unit

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada

Nunavut Regional Office

P.O. Box 100

Igaluit, Nunavut X0A OHO

Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

Phone: (867) 975-4289

Fax: (867) 979-6445

B.B (867) 222- 6488

Neil H. Shubin

3/2/2015
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Senior Advisor to the President

Robert R. Bensley Distinguished Service Professor of Anatomy
The University of Chicago

1027 E. 57th Street

Chicago, IL 60637

Ph: 773-834-7472
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