3/19/2015 Nunavut Water Board Mail - [Licensing] Fwd: 3BC-YIF1313- Expired

-
gL

F2°%%
@“ MNWE Tools Megan Porter <megan.porter@nwb-oen.ca>
= L ‘_

[Licensing] Fwd: 3BC-YIF1313- Expired

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Feb 4, 2015 at 12:44 PM
To: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>
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------—--- Forwarded message --------—

From: Andrew Keim <Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>

Date: Wed, Jan 28, 2015 at 11:50 AM

Subject: Re: 3BC-YIF1313- Expired

To: "Lee, Karen" <karen@windfallfilms.com>

Cc: "Allain, Erik" <Erik.Allain@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>, phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca

Good Morning Karen,

Sorry for the delay in replying but | have been away from my desk the last few days in meetings.

If your company has no intention of returning to the locations/ sites | will require an annual report be filed with the
Nunavut Water Board.

The requirement to complete an annual report appears on Page 4 of the License and it outlines those items that are to
be included in the report.

| have included a copy of your license as well as a blank copy/template of the required Annual report.

Please submit this form, once complete, to the Manager of Licensing at the Nunavut Water Board ( Phyllis Beaulieu.
Licensing@NWB-OEN.CA ) and myself.

Once the Board has approved your Annual Report I will schedule an Inspection of the sites and from their either recommend

closure of the License or require remedial works be completed prior to License cancellation.

If you have any further questions please do not hesitate to ask.
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Andrew Keim

Water Resources Officer

Field Operations Unit

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada
Nunavut Regional Office

P.O. Box 100

Iqaluit, Nunavut X0A OHO
Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca

Phone: (867) 975-4289

Fax: (867) 979-6445

B.B (867) 222- 6488

>>> Karen Lee <karen@windfallfilms.com> 1/28/2015 9:04 AM >>>
Dear Andrew Keim,

Your email to Mr David Duggan has been forwarded to me.
We did indeed obtain a water license from you in relation to filming activity we carried-out between 3rd and 7th July
2013, when our crew followed Professor Neil Shubin on one of his expeditions.

I'm not entirely clear from your below email of what information exactly you require from us now. Would you be so kind
as to explain? It may be that | will have to consult with Professor Shubin so I'd rather be absolutely clear about the
info. we need from him.

We are aware that our licence has now expired - and have no plan to return to the site this year.
With thanks and best wishes,

Karen Lee

Karen Lee
Line Producer

One Underwood Row

London N1 7LZ

Tel: +44 (0) 20 7251 7676
D/L: +44 (0) 20 7251 7681
Fax: +44 (0) 20 7253 8468

www.windfallfilms.com

This email message is confidential and for use by the addressee only. If the message is received by anyone other than the addressee, please return the message to the sender by replying to it and then delete the

message from your computer. Internet emails are not necessarily secure. Windfall Films does not accept resp ibility for ges made to this after it was sent.
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Date: 21 January 2015 21:18:27 GMT

From: "Andrew Keim" <Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>
To: <Kristina@windfallfilms.com>

Cc: "Erik Allain" <Erik.Allain@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca>
Subject: 3BC-YIF1313- Expired

David Duggan

Windfall Films

One Underwood Row

London N1 7LZ (UK)

Contact: Kristina Obradovic (Head of Production)
Phone: 011-44-207-251-7668

Fax: 011-44-207-253-8468

e-mail: Kristina@windfallfilms.com

Mr. Duggan,

The Field Operations Unit of Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada is
currently engaged in conducting our annual Risk Prioritization Exercise in preparation for
the 2015 field season.

It has come to our attention that the above noted Water license for work Planned in 2013
has expired. Our review of the file is unable to produce either an application for renewal or
an application for cancellation of the expired License.

In addition to the enclosed assessment form to be completed and returned to our offices by
March 31st 2015, | have included a copy of your Water License. | appreciate your
cooperation as we move ahead with this file.

| am specifically interested in what work was conducted during the term of the License as
there appear to be none of the required Annual Reports on file for the life of your project.

If you have any questions or concerns please do not hesitate to contact myself or the
Manager of Licensing at the Nunavut Water Board, Phyllis Beaulieu Manager of Licensing
Nunavut Water Board. Licensing@NWB-OEN.CA

Thank you in advance for your continued cooperation,

Andrew Keim

Water Resources Officer

Field Operations Unit

Aboriginal Affairs and Northern Development Canada
Nunavut Regional Office

P.O. Box 100

Iqaluit, Nunavut X0A OHO
Andrew.Keim@aandc-aadnc.gc.ca
Phone: (867) 975-4289

Fax: (867) 979-6445

B.B (867) 222- 6488

<IQALUIT+#705369-v1-130610_3BC-YIF1313_LICENCE-OKKE_PDF.PDF>
<2015 PROJECT ASSESSMENT CHECKSHEET.DOCX>
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