From: NWB Manager of Licensing [licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca]

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2005 1:19 PM

To: Colette Scobie

Subject: RE: Request for review and comments - Amendment toNWB3CAP0207 - New Sewage Lagoon

Good afternoon. We just received the cheque in the mail today and were wondering what file it was to be applied to. | will have to
return to cheque as it's made out to Nunavut Water Board rather than Receiver General for Canada. You can also pay the fee by Visa
if that will make the transaction easier. Just provide the Visa information to me and | will forward the info to Indian Affairs in

lgaluit. They, in turn, will issue a receipt for the payment. The Visa information will be kept confidential in our office.

Regards,

Phyllis Beaulieu

Manager of Licensing

Nunavut Water Board

P.O. Box 119

Gjoa Haven, NU XOB 1J0

Phone: (867) 360-6338

Fax: (867) 360-6369

E-mail: licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca

----- Original Message-----

From: Colette Scobie [mailto:CScobie@dillon.ca]

Sent: Friday, September 09, 2005 8:01 AM

To: licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca

Cc: Janet Bradley

Subject: Fwd: Request for review and comments - Amendment toNWB3CAP0207 - New Sewage Lagoon

Good Morning Ms Beaulieu,

On September 6/05, we mailed you a cheque for $30.00 in order to take care of the fee mentioned in this email thread. | was
wondering if you would be able to fax or email me some sort of invoice that I can send to our head office as back up for this
cheque?

Also, Heather went on holidays just after this request was made, and | did not receive this email until this morning. | was
unaware that the cheque was asked to be made out to the "Receiver General for Canada", and therefore | had the cheque
made payable to the "Nunavut Water Board". Is this something that must be remedied, or will it be alright?

Thanks very much,

Colette Scobie
Reception/Word Processing
Dillon Consulting Ltd
Yellowknife NT
867-920-4555 phone
867-873-3328 fax
cscobie@dillon.ca

>>> Heather Scott 09/09/05 8:47 am >>>
Request for $30.00 below.

>>> Gary Strong 08/08/05 9:10 am >>>
If you're looking for work. the NWB updated their application form. I'll send it to you. The infor that we previously submitted is
in the elctronic file 054319-2000-application

>>> "NWB Manager of Licensing" <_licensing@nwb.nunavut.ca > 08/05/05 9:51 AM >>>
See attached letter requesting review and comments on the above. Deadline
is September 3, 2005.

GARY - a reminder that the $30.00 administration fee has not been paid.
Please provide in cheque form, made payable to "Receiver General for Canada"
or you may provide Visa information and pay that way.

Regards,
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Phyllis Beaulieu

Manager of Licensing
Nunavut Water Board
P.O. Box 119

Gjoa Haven, NU X0B 1J0
Phone: (867) 360-6338
Fax: (867) 360-6369

E-mail: licensing@nwhb.nunavut.ca
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