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Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Re: Amendment Application for Repulse Bay Water Licence 3BM-REP-0409
1 message

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Mar 26, 2014 at 4:43 PM
To: "Alam, Shah" <SAlam@gov.nu.ca>
Cc: Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>, Sean Joseph <sean.joseph@nwb-oen.ca>

Good afternoon Shah
We previously received some information on the renewal for the Hamlet of Repulse.  Please review what is on the ftp site right now and advise if any of the
information is to be considered for the renewal.  Here is the link direct to the submissions previously received.  USERNAME public and PASSWORD
registry
ftp://nunavutwaterboard.org/1%20PRUC/3%20MUNICIPAL/3B/3BM%20-%20Municipality/3BM-REP0409/1%20APPLICATION/2009%20Renewal/

We await your response.

Regards,

On Tue, Mar 25, 2014 at 12:04 PM, Alam, Shah <SAlam@gov.nu.ca> wrote:

 

Hi Phyllis,

 

I am pleased to submit the Water Licence Amendment Application for the Hamlet of Repulse Bay  of Kivaliq Region, Nunavut on behalf of the Hamlet of
Repulse bay.

 

Please  find the attached files of the Amendment Application package and outstanding Annual Reports 2004-2011 for the Licence 3BM-REP-0409
including Executive Summary page and water-sewage effluent Test Results 2012. Annual Report 2013 will be sent by March 31, 2014

 

A $30 cheque for Licence Amendment/Renewal Fee paid by the Hamlet and sent to Nunavut Water Board by Canada Post .

 

Attachment included:
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1.       Amendment Application package

2.       Annual Reports 2004-2011: as requested since outstanding

 

Due to file sizing constraint, other Documents are sending in separate email(s) – sorry for this inconvenience.

 

Thanking you for your consideration.

 

Regards,

 

Shah Alam, P. Eng.

Municipal Planning Engineer,

Government of Nunavut

Community and Government Services

Kitikmeot Region,

Cambridge Bay, Nu

Phone: 867-983-4156, fax: 867-983-4124

salam@gov.nu.ca<mailto:salam@gov.nu.ca>
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