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RE: Response to inquiry regarding 3BC-EUR1116
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Ste-Marie, Marc (EC/EC) <marc.ste-marie@canada.ca> Thu, Nov 5, 2015 at 7:38 AM
To: Cynthia Ene <cynthia.ene@nwb-oen.ca>

Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>, "Cloutier-Dussault, Jean-Philippe (EC/EC)" <jean-philippe.cloutier-
dussault@canada.ca>

Bonjour Cynthia,

Just wanted to let you know that we our looking in to answering your questions as soon as possible. | would also like
to apologize for forgetting to answer your first e-mail in September.

It was a pleasure talking to you too.
Merci

Marc

De : Cynthia Ene [mailto:cynthia.ene@nwb-oen.ca]

Envoyé : 4 November 2015 4:49

A : Ste-Marie, Marc (EC/EC); jean.philippe.cloutier-dussault@ec.gc.ca
Cc : Licensing Department

Objet : Re: Response to inquiry regarding 3BC-EUR1116

Good Afternoon Mr. Ste Marie,

It was a pleasure speaking with you this afternoon. As discussed the Nunavut Water Board has yet to receive a response
to our previously submitted questions concerning the on-site quarrying, previously sent email is included below and dated
Sept 25, 2015.

| look forward to hearing from you. In the mean time if you should have any further questions please do not hesitate to
contact me.

Sincere regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=6896ea2ed2&view=pt&search=inbox&th=150d81600e3269ed&sim|=150d81600e3269ed 13
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On Fri, Sep 25, 2015 at 2:59 PM, Cynthia Ene <cynthia.ene@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:

Sorry for the delayed response, | have only recently been made aware of your request for clarification sent September 3,
2015.

Following a review of EC's proposed quarrying activities as listed in the "Quarry Operation Plan" (Nuna, 2015), | would
appreciate if you could elaborate on the following issues:

- Whether quarrying activities or the use of subsequent fill material will involve any use of water not already allowed
under the licence, or in quantities now allowed under the licence. For example, water use for gravel washing, pit-
dewatering, dust suppression, etc.

- Whether any deposit of waste to water is expected as a result of quarrying activities, either from the use of deleterious
substances or due to runoff.

- How waste resulting from the mobile carwash at Blacktop Creek will be managed.

- Confirmation that no quarrying activities will occur within 100 metres of any water source.

Regards,
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