
12/10/2015 Nunavut Water Board Mail ­ RE: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour , NU

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6896ea2ed2&view=pt&search=inbox&th=1518820548563e8c&siml=1518820548563e8c 1/4

Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca>

RE: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour , NU
1 message

Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com> Wed, Dec 9, 2015 at 12:03 PM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca>

Phyllis:

Thanks, that is great re use of Visa, no water use is anticipated for this project. Back to you soon!!! Rick

 

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca] 
Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2015 11:01 AM
To: Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com>
Subject: Re: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour , NU

 

Good day Rick, the administration fee is $30.00 and certainly can be paid with Visa.  If there is any water use authorized there will also be a
water use fee to be paid but that can be discussed once we receive the application.

Regards, 

 

On Wed, Dec 9, 2015 at 9:31 AM, Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com> wrote:

Phyllis:

Good morning, I am pleased to advise that we are preparing to transmit the Water Licence Application and supporting documentation
for the Coral Harbour Community Road bridge rehab project to you before the end of this week but please advise the fee for this
application, and can we pay you over the phone (i.e. by visa)? Your direction on this would be appreciated.

 

Rick
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Rick Hoos, MSc., R.P. Bio.| Principal Consultant

p. 604.608.8914 | c. 604.813.4952| f. 604.684.6241

rick.hoos@tetratech.com

 

Tetra Tech EBA
Suite 1000, 10th Floor, 885 Dunsmuir St. Vancouver, BC V6C 1N5 | tetratech.com | eba.ca

 

        Please consider the environment before printing. Read More.

 

This message, including any attachments, may include privileged, confidential and/or inside information. Any distribution or use of this
communication by anyone other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender by replying to this message and then delete it from your system.

 

 

 

 

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca] 
Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2015 12:01 PM
To: Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com>
Cc: Sharma, Ashwani <ASharma@gov.nu.ca>; Licensing Department (licensing@nwb­oen.ca) <licensing@nwb­oen.ca>;
Moschini, David <David.Moschini@tetratech.com>
Subject: Re: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour , NU

 

Thanks Rick, that is fine

 

On Tue, Nov 24, 2015 at 12:10 PM, Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com> wrote:

Phyllis:

Thanks for asking, we have just recently received the proposed plan  for rehabilitation of the stream crossings and anticipate submitting
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the application and supporting documentation in early December. We trust this will be acceptable to you. Regards, rick 

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 24, 2015, at 10:51 AM, Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca> wrote:

Can we expect an application anytime soon for this project?

 

 

On Wed, Sep 30, 2015 at 1:31 PM, Sharma, Ashwani <ASharma@gov.nu.ca> wrote:

Good Afternoon,

 

Please find attached letter of authorization for Tetra Tech EBA.

 

Thanks,

 

Best Regards,

Ashwani Kumar Sharma,

Project Officer,

Rankin Inlet, NU, X0C 0G0,

Tel: 867 645 8180

Email: ASharma@GOV.NU.CA

 

From: Sharma, Ashwani 
Sent: September 30, 2015 2:28 PM
To: 'Hoos, Rick'
Cc: Phyllis Beaulieu (phyllis.beaulieu@nwb­oen.ca); David Moschini (David.Moschini@tetratech.com); Duguay, Brian
Subject: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour , NU
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Hi Rick,

 

Please find attached letter of authorization as requested.

 

Please feel free to contact undersigned, if have any questions/concerns?

 

Thanks,

 

Best Regards,

Ashwani Kumar Sharma,

Project Officer,

Rankin Inlet, NU, X0C 0G0,

Tel: 867 645 8180

Email: ASharma@GOV.NU.CA
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