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RE: Water Licence Application for Coral Harbour Airport Community Road Washout
Rehabilitation Project, Coral Harbour , NU
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Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos @tetratech.com> Thu, Dec 10, 2015 at 1:39 PM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Cc: "Sharma, Ashwani" <ASharma@gov.nu.ca>, "Duguay, Brian" <BDuguay@gov.nu.ca>, "Mentink, Erin"
<EMentink@gov.nu.ca>, "Lusty, Megan" <MLusty@gov.nu.ca>, "Moschini, David" <David.Moschini@tetratech.com>

Phyllis:

On behalf of the Nunavut Department of Community and Government Services, Tetra Tech EBA is pleased to provide
for the Nunavut Water Board’s consideration, the following Water Licence Application documents for the Coral
Harbour Airport Community Road Rehabilitation Project:

1. Completed General Water Licence Application

2. Completed SIG spreadsheet

3. Supplementary Information Report

Several subsequent emails will contain the following additional supporting documents in digitally manageable
sections:

4. EBA A Tetra Tech Company. 2013. Airport Community Road Washout Report for Coral Harbour Nunavut.

5. Tetra Tech EBA. 2015. Feasibility review of crossings alternatives under Airport Road, Coral Harbour.

6. Tetra Tech EBA. 2015. Coral Harbour Airport Road Hydraulic Upgrades: Design Options Report.

As noted on the sighature page of the Application, the Inuktitut Summary of the Project is currently being generated
and will be provided to the NWB, tentatively by the end of next week (December 18, 2015).

Regarding payment of the Application fee, please advise a time when | can phone you to make the necessary
payment.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=6896ea2ed2&view=pt&search=inbox&th=1518d9f053ca359%e&simI=1518d9f053ca35% 1/4
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Finally, please confirm receipt of this application documentation. We look forward to working with you and the Board
with regard to the processing of this application.

Regards,
Rick

Rick Hoos, MSc., R.P. Bio.| Principal Consultant
p.604.608.8914 | ¢.604.813.4952| f. 604.684.6241

rick.hoos@tetratech.com

Tetra Tech EBA
Suite 1000, 10th Floor, 885 Dunsmuir St. Vancouver, BC V6C 1N5 | tetratech.com | eba.ca

n D m Please consider the environment before printing. Read More.

This message, including any attachments, may include privileged, confidential and/or inside information. Any distribution or use of
this communication by anyone other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the
intended recipient, please notify the sender by replying to this message and then delete it from your system.

From: Phyllis Beaulieu [mailto:phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca]

Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2015 11:01 AM

To: Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com>

Subject: Re: Authorization : Tetra Tech EBA, Airport Community Road Washout, Coral Harbour, NU

Good day Rick, the administration fee is $30.00 and certainly can be paid with Visa. If there is any water use authorized
there will also be a water use fee to be paid but that can be discussed once we receive the application.

Regards,
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On Wed, Dec 9, 2015 at 9:31 AM, Hoos, Rick <Rick.Hoos@tetratech.com> wrote:
Phyllis:

Good morning, | am pleased to advise that we are preparing to transmit the Water Licence Application and
supporting documentation for the Coral Harbour Community Road bridge rehab project to you before the end of
this week but please advise the fee for this application, and can we pay you over the phone (i.e. by visa)? Your
direction on this would be appreciated.

Rick
Rick Hoos, MSc., R.P. Bio.| Principal Consultant

p.604.608.8914 | ¢.604.813.4952| f. 604.684.624 1rick.hoos@tetratech.com

Tetra Tech EBA
Suite 1000, 10th Floor, 885 Dunsmuir St. Vancouver, BC V6C 1N5 | tetratech.com | eba.ca

n a m Please consider the environment before printing. Read More.

This message, including any attachments, may include privileged, confidential and/or inside information. Any distribution or use
of this communication by anyone other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the
intended recipient, please notify the sender by replying to this message and then delete it from your system.

3 attachments

ﬂ 100401-General_Water_Licence_Application-OEDE-edited130401.pdf
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@ 110127-Completed-NWB-M1-WaterWorks-SIG-kt.xls
287K

ﬂ Supplementary Information Report Coral Harbour_IFU.pdf
5354K
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