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Re: 140218 8WLC-AFP---- WL Application Acknowledgement for the Alexandra Fiord Project

Erik Skiby <erik.skiby@nwb-oen.ca> Tue, Feb 25, 2014 at 9:22 AM
To: "Piepjohn, Karsten" <Karsten.Piepjohn@bgr.de>
Cc: Megan Porter <megan.porter@nwb-oen.ca>, "Kasch, Christoph" <Christoph.Kasch@bgr.de>

Hi Karsten,

| find the wording of the question is a little bit confusing as well, In the two statements where you had placed "N/A", the questions are asking you to certify the
answers you had previously answered in block 9 and 11, respectively.

in your case you had stated in block 9:

For an undertaking other than a Power undertaking and for any use of water
less than 50 maper day.

and block 11 you had stated:

For any Other type of undertaking not listed above, other than Municipal, any deposit of
sewage to a sump

Therefore, | can not accept N/A as a response, in the signature block, you must either answer "YES" or "NO" to the statements

In the signature blocks, it's referring to schedules in our regulations in which the question were derived from, the two schedules referred to in the signature block
provide greater clarity to what is allowed under this authorization. Please see link to regulations for further information http://laws.justice.gc.ca/PDF/SOR-2013-
69.pdf

Please don't hesitate to call me if you require further assistants or clarification.

Erik
On Mon, Feb 24, 2014 at 3:53 AM, Piepjohn, Karsten <Karsten.Piepjohn@bgr.de> wrote:

Hi Megan Porter,

| have received am email by Erik Skiby where he stated that our application is not correct yet (see below). The reason for checking off the two
statements in block 13 as “N/A” was that | did not really know how to answer both questions. If you can help me, then | can change the application
and send it back to you with the corrections.

Thanks a lot und viele liebe Gruesse,

Karsten Piepjohn

Von: Erik Skiby [mailto:erik.skiby@nwb-oen.ca]

Gesendet: Freitag, 21. Februar 2014 22:07

An: Megan Porter

Cc: Piepjohn, Karsten; Licensing Department

Betreff: Re: 140218 8WLC-AFP---- WL Application Acknowledgement for the Alexandra Fiord Project

Hi Megan,
I am not sure how things are looking administratively, I've just looked at the application and there needs to be a few changes before | can accept it technically.

The main concerns is in block 13 ( signature block) of the application, where the applicant must certify the various statements. there are two statements that
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have been checked off as N/A, the statements must be checked "yes"" or "no" as they are applicable and must be certified by the applicant. if there are
questions regarding the statements that require to be certified, please direct them my way.

A new application can be filled out, or changes can be made to the current application, but | would require initials beside any changes made in the application

along with a quick e-mail stating that changes have been made from the previous application on file.

Thanks,

Erik
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On Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 4:01 PM, Megan Porter <megan.porter@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:

The Nunawt Water Board Licensing Department acknowledges receipt on February 12, 2014 of your Application For An Approval Without A Licence. Currently

the application is being reviewed internally for administrative completeness. You will be notified in due course of any deficiencies prior to forwarding the file to
the technical department for review and issue of a one year approval.

Regards,
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distribution, copying, or dizclosure i strictly prohibited. If you have recerved this by mistale, please notify the sender immediately and delete this message without printing, or
copying it. Thank you.

AVIS DE CONFIDENTIALITE - Ce messaze, ef lonle(s) pidce(s) jomie(s) est conDidenticl et et i Tusaze exelusil dufes) deginataire(s) ci-dessus, Toule aulre persomme esl par
la présente avisée qu'il lul est srictement interdit de le dittuzer, le distribuer ou le reproduire. Si le destinataire ne peut étre joint ou vous est inconnu, veuillez informer
l'expéditenr par cowmier électronique imm édiatement et détruire ce meszsage et toute copie de celui-ci. Merci pour votre collaboration.

h% Merci de penzer a l'environnement avant d'imprimer ce conrriel / Thank yon for thinking of the environment before printing this email
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