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Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca> Wed, Apr 10, 2019 at 10:46 AM
To: Etienne Godin <egodin5@uwo.ca>
Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>

Hello Etienne,

It may be easier to backhaul all solid waste to an approved facility (landfill). If, however, you decide that open burning is
the way to go, please be advised that there are guidelines in place to be followed:

¢ Government of Nunavut Department of Environment, Environmental Guideline for the Burning and Incineration of
Solid Waste, revised January 2012;

¢ Environment and Climate Change Canada, Open Burning of Garbage Brochure, dated 2010; and

¢ Canadian Council of Ministers of the Environment, Guidance Document for Canadian Jurisdictions on Open-Air
Burning, dated 2016.

As for annual reports, | am attaching last year's approval for your project. For such approvals, the requirement is a bit
different than for licences in the sense that you are not required to submit a report if you have another approval or licence
for the same project: "The Authorized Entity need not submit the report referred to in ltem 8 (c) if the Authorized Entity
obtains a new approval authorizing a use of Water or deposit of Waste without a licence, or a licence authorizing a use of
Water or deposit of Waste for the same undertaking on the same site within thirty (30) days after the last day of the period
previously authorized".

The contents for a report are outlined in the Approval.
Hope this helps - please don't hesitate to give me a call.

Regards,
Assol
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On Wed, Apr 10, 2019 at 7:05 AM Etienne Godin <egodin5@uwo.ca> wrote:
Dear Assol Kubeisinova,

thank you for the follow up !
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To answer the questions:

1. about the incineration: we do not have an actual incinerator, it

would be something like open burning. The type of things we think about
burning are cardboards from boxes and whatever that can be burned
easily. The preferred option is to bring back everything and not burn
anything on site, like we did last year.

2. about 3BC-HIS1313 - it was well before my time | think. | will
forward your request to my supervisor so he take contact with you to
fix the matter.

| tried to find information about how to prepare yearly report on
the site for the NWB but to not avail. Could you re-specify the
procedures about yearly reporting and also tell me if | am late
providing reports to your organization?

cordially,

Etienne

On Tue, 09 Apr 2019 17:25:14 -0600
Assol Kubeisinova <assol.kubeisinova@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:

> Dear Etienne Godin,

>

> | am writing in regards to you application to NWB for an approval to
> use water and deposit waste. The application states that some solid
> waste will be incinerated - are you planning to operate an

> incinerator or utilize open burning? What kinds of solid waste would
> be incinerated?

>

> In addition to that, could you please clarify what your plans in

> regards to licence No. 3BC-HIS1313 are? NWB received only one annual
> report in April 2015. | would encourage you to apply for a

> cancellation of 3BC-HIS1313 because, as as stated in s. 46 of the
> Nunavut Waters and Nunavut Surface Rights Tribunal Act, the expiry or
> cancellation of this licence does not relieve the holder from any

> outstanding obligations imposed under the licence. If there are any
> obligations under Type “B” Water Licences No. 3BC-HIS1313 that remain
> outstanding (such as obligations in relation to payment of water

> fees, filing of plans for approval and restoration, etc.) the

> Authorized Entity remains responsible for fulfilling these

> obligations.

>

> Regards,

> Assol

>

>

>

>

>

> >

> >

> >

> > e Forwarded message ---------

> > From: Ida Porter <ida.porter@nwb-oen.ca>

> > Date: Mon, Apr 1, 2019 at 9:51 AM

> > Subject: Re: NWB - License renewal

> > To: Etienne Godin <egodin5@uwo.ca>

> > Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>
> >
> >
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> > Good morning Etienne,

> >

> > Thank you for submitting the application supporting documents.
> > Please note your application is now being reviewed if there is

> > anything else required | will respond to you.

> >

> > Regards,

> > |da
> >

> >
> >

[Quoted text hidden]

Dept. of Earth Sciences - WSC G27
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