
Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Re: 140708 3BC-HAP1111 Acknowledgement of Application-OMLE
1 message

Patricia Sutherland <psutherl@istar.ca> Thu, Jul 24, 2014 at 6:57 AM
To: Phyllis Beaulieu <phyllis.beaulieu@nwb-oen.ca>

Dear Phyllis,

I have been away at location for which there was no e-mail access.  As indicated in a previous e-mail, the 
project work for this summer has been cancelled so no approval without a licence is required. Also, as 
indicated earlier, I plan to continue work at Cape Tanfield next year and it would be a full field season. In 
that instance, if regulations permit, it may be best to deal the the B licence at that time.  A report on the 
2011 season is forthcoming.

Pat Sutherland

Patricia D. Sutherland, PhD
Northlands Research
Phone/Fax (001) 613-832-2244
Adjunct Research Professor, Carleton and Memorial universities
Research Fellow, University of Aberdeen

On 2014-07-23, at 5:58 PM, Phyllis Beaulieu wrote:

Please provide a response to my email above.  Do you plan on moving forward with the 
cancellation of the B Licence and obtaining an approval without a licence for the project?
Thanks. 

PS the annual report is still required for the type B file.  If no activity took place on the project 
in 2011 please provide a letter indicating same.

On Tue, Jul 15, 2014 at 8:59 AM, Phyllis Beaulieu >oen.ca-phyllis.beaulieu@nwb<  wrote:
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We still require an annual report for 2011 for file 3BC-HAP1111 when you were out on the 
project. Can that be provided so we can move forward to cancel/close this file and 
indication from AANDC that no issues are outstanding?

You indicate above that the field season for this year is cancelled.  Does that mean that 
you wish to now cancel the approval without a licence that was just issued?
Please advise.
Regards, 

On Thu, Jul 10, 2014 at 4:37 PM, Patricia Sutherland >psutherl@istar.ca<  wrote:
Thank you for your message, Phyllis. Regrettably, the field season for this summer has 
been cancelled.  I hope to return  to the cape to undertake a full field season in 2015. 

Regards,

Pat  Sutherland

Patricia D. Sutherland, PhD
Northlands Research
Phone/Fax (001) 613-832-2244
Adjunct Research Professor, Carleton and Memorial universities
Research Fellow, University of Aberdeen

On 2014-07-08, at 6:49 PM, Phyllis Beaulieu wrote:

Hi Patricia, under the terms and conditions of the licence for 3BC-HAP1111 
there is a requirement to submit an annual report.  Our office has no record 
of receiving one.  If there was no activity on site then a basic letter/memo 
advising same would suffice.  Please reference Part B, Item 2 of the 
attached.
Regards, 

On Tue, Jul 8, 2014 at 2:51 PM, Patricia Sutherland >psutherl@istar.ca<
wrote:

 Hello Phyllis,
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You did not mention this earlier and I am not clear on what you are 
requesting. 

Thank you,

Pat

Patricia D. Sutherland, PhD
Northlands Research
Phone/Fax (001) 613-832-2244
Adjunct Research Professor, Carleton and Memorial universities
Research Fellow, University of Aberdeen

On 2014-07-08, at 4:44 PM, Phyllis Beaulieu wrote:

The Nunavut Water Board acknowledges receipt on June 
26, 2014 of an application to cancel the above water 
licence.  In order to move forward with this request please 
provide a copy of the 2011 annual report or NRI summary 
report for our records. 

Also required is the $30.00 admin fee, which I understand 
is in the mail.

You will be notified of any other technical deficiencies once 
Karen has completed his preliminary technical review.

Regards, 
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