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Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca> Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 4:02 PM
To: nshubin@uchicago.edu
Cc: Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>, Erik Skiby <erik.skiby@nwb-oen.ca>

Hi Niel,

The Nunavut Water Board acknowledges receipt on February 12, 2014 of your application for approval for the use of water or deposit of waste without a licence
for the Search of Early Animal Fossils Project. The NWB Licensing Department has conducted a preliminary review of your application and has determined that
a Type "B" licence already exists for this project. The Type "B" licence will have to be officially closed by an Inspector of Aboriginal Affairs and Northern
Development Canada (AANDC) therefore please submit an application for cancellation along with the $30.00 admin fee.

In the meantime we will further process your application for water use without a licence. 

Regards,
Robin Ikkutisluk

Neil Shubin <neil.shubin@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 4:12 PM
Reply-To: neil.shubin@gmail.com
To: Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>
Cc: Neil Shubin <nshubin@uchicago.edu>, Licensing Department <licensing@nwb-oen.ca>, Erik Skiby <erik.skiby@nwb-oen.ca>

Thanks: Do you have information on where I can access the cancellation materials?  And, can I provide credit card information for payment? Best, Neil

[Quoted text hidden]

-- 
Neil H. Shubin

Senior Advisor to the President
Robert R. Bensley Distinguished Service Professor of Anatomy
The University of Chicago
1027 E. 57th Street
Chicago, IL 60637
Ph: 773-834-7472
_____________________________________________________________
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Neil Shubin <neil.shubin@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 4:13 PM
Reply-To: neil.shubin@gmail.com
To: Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca>

Dear Robin,

Thanks: Do you have information on where I can access the cancellation materials?  And, can I provide credit card information for payment? 

Best, Neil

-- 
Neil H. Shubin

Senior Advisor to the President
Robert R. Bensley Distinguished Service Professor of Anatomy
The University of Chicago
1027 E. 57th Street
Chicago, IL 60637
Ph: 773-834-7472
_____________________________________________________________

Your Inner Fish | PBS Wednesdays starting April 9th at 10/9c

pbs.org/innerfish | twitter.com/tangled_bank_

On Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 5:02 PM, Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

-- 
Neil H. Shubin

Senior Advisor to the President
Robert R. Bensley Distinguished Service Professor of Anatomy
The University of Chicago
1027 E. 57th Street
Chicago, IL 60637
Ph: 773-834-7472
_____________________________________________________________

Your Inner Fish | PBS Wednesdays starting April 9th at 10/9c

pbs.org/innerfish | twitter.com/tangled_bank_

 

Robin Ikkutisluk <robin.ikkutisluk@nwb-oen.ca> Tue, Feb 18, 2014 at 4:55 PM
To: Neil Shubin <neil.shubin@gmail.com>

Hi Niel,

I've attached the application forms for cancellation and they can also be found on our ftp site at the following link: Username public Password registry
ftp://nunavutwaterboard.org/ADMINISTRATION/Water%20License%20Applications/ 

Payments are available by cheques and visa, If you would like to make a payment through Visa you can give me a call here in the office at (867) 360-6338 ext.
29.

Regards,
Robin Ikkutisluk
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